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Visual search is our top pick for AR use cases that will birth killer apps. It has all the ingredients: true 
utility and frequency. It also alleviates pain points. Holding up a phone to identify something is easier 
than typing in many situations. Google, the visual search heir apparent, is investing heavily. 
 
Visual search also speaks to affinities of increasingly-buying empowered millennials, given comfort 
levels with the camera as an input. And it’s particularly fitting to lots of monetizable use cases such as 
product-based visual searches during “high-intent” moments (think: retails store aisles). 
 
Of course, all of the above is theoretical given visual search’s attributes and their alignment with 
typical killer app requirements. But we’re also starting to see supporting evidence in consumers’ 
reported interest. For example, eMarketer reports 33 percent of consumers want visual search. 
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More specifically, 21 percent “have not used but very interested,” while 7 percent have used but not 
regularly. 3 percent use it regularly. If we expand the analysis to those “somewhat interested,” the 
total share of those who want visual search grows to 58 percent, pushing into the majority. 
 
However, the elephant in the room is the low percentage of frequent users, at 3 percent. This stands 
to reason, given that visual search hasn’t culturally acclimated as a critical use case, though we 
believe it will. It’s also been harder to find and use in terms of “activation energy.” 
 
The latter could change, given momentum to position visual search in easier places. As the 
underlying computer vision improves, we believe more visual search providers (Pinterest, Google, 
Snapchat, etc.) will do just that. Google already has, given its recent iOS integration. 
 

 
 
 
Back to the 33 percent figure, it aligns with data from our research arm, ARtillery Intelligence. In the 
consumer AR survey (n=2,198), co-produced with survey research firm Thrive Analytics, 33 percent 
of respondents were interested in in-store product info (a top form of visual search). 
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This will be a moving target that we’ll continue to track, due to its importance for pushing spatial 
computing further into the mainstream. Given the killer app attributes listed above, visual search has 
the best chance of doing that, thereby exposing and accelerating AR in general. 
 
Stay tuned for the next wave of consumer survey research with Thrive Analytics, published in an 
upcoming ARtillery Intelligence report. Meanwhile, check out the last wave, as well as our review of 
Google Lens. It’s best positioned to rule visual search, given Google’s knowledge graph. 

Video Companion 
(click URL to view) 
 

https://youtu.be/xNL6f9mStAU
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About ARtillery Intelligence 
 
ARtillery Intelligence chronicles the evolution of augmented reality (AR) and virtual reality (VR). 
Through writings and multimedia, it provides deep and analytical views into the industry’s biggest 
players, opportunities and strategies. It’s about insights, not cheerleading. 
 
Run by analysts and former journalists, coverage is grounded in a disciplined and journalistic 
approach. It also maintains a business angle: Though there are lots of fun and games in AR & VR, 
long-term cultural, technological and financial implications are primary. 
 
Products include the AR Insider publication and the ARtillery PRO research subscription., which 
together engender a circular flow of knowledge. Research includes monthly Intelligence Briefings, 
market-sizing forecasts and consumer survey data, all housed in a robust intelligence vault. 
 

Learn more at https://artillry.co/about  
 

 
  

https://artillry.co/
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About the Author 
Mike Boland was one of Silicon Valley's first tech reporters of the Internet age, as a staff reporter for 
Forbes (print) starting in 2000. He has been an industry analyst covering mobile and social media 
since 2005, and is now Chief Analyst of ARtillery Intelligence and Editor-in-Chief of AR Insider. 
  
Mike is a frequent speaker at industry conferences such as VRLA, ad:tech and LeadsCon. He has 
authored in-depth reports and market-sizing forecasts on the changing tech & media landscape. He 
contributes regularly to highly read online news sources such as TechCrunch, Business Insider and 
the Huffington Post. 
  
A trusted source for tech journalists, his comments have appeared in A-list publications, including The 
New Yorker, The Wall Street Journal and The New York Times.   
 
Further background, history and credentials can be found at: 

http://www.mikebo.land/  
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Contact 
Questions and requests for deeper analysis can be submitted at: 

https://artillry.co/contact/ 

 
 

 
 
 

Disclosure and Ethics Policy 
 
ARtillery Intelligence operates under the Society of Professional Journalists Code of Ethics. All 
material and commentary are published with the professional standards and tactics of journalistic 
reporting. Adherence to such standards is grounded in and reinforced by our foundations in 
journalism. 
 
All ARtillery Intelligence published material is meant to educate and inform: It does not result from 
paid placement, nor influence from subjects. In rare cases of sponsored posts, vested interest or 
anything that results from money changing hands, financial relationship is disclosed clearly. 
 
Similarly with market sizing, ARtillery Intelligence remains independent of players and practitioners in 
the sectors it covers, thus mitigating bias in industry revenue calculations and projections. 
ARtillery Intelligence disclosure and ethics policy can be seen in full at: 
 

https://artillry.co/about/disclosure-and-ethics-policy/ 
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